





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 12 TO 18 DECEMBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 12 AU 18 DECEMBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
KME160152	12/12/2016	FEDERAL DEFENSE INDUSTRIES INC	US
		NORCATEC LLC	US
		DEFENSE TRADING CORPORATION	US
		MAK SAVUNMA SANAYI LTD STI	TR
		M INTERNATIONAL EXPORT MINTEX INC	US
		INTEGRATED PROCUREMENT TECHNOLOGIES	US
ANH16042	15/12/2016	DST DEFENCE SERVICE TRACKS GMBH	DE
		FFG FLENSBURGER FAHRZEUGBAU GMBH	DE
		FWW FAHRZEUGWERK GMBH	DE





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 05 TO 11 DECEMBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 05 AU 11 DECEMBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
BBE16012	09/12/2016	MIETSEL SA	GR
		PARTYARD LDA	PT
		DEFENSE TRADING CORPORATION	US
		INTRACOM DEFENSE ELECTRONIC SYSTEMS	GR
		THALES COMMUNICATIONS	FR
		HARRIS CORP	US





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 28 NOV TO 04 DECEMBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 28 NOV AU 04 DECEMBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
ASA16001R1	30/11/2016	MBDA FRANCE	FR
ELK16039	30/11/2016	MORAGLIS SA	GR
		ELVE SA	GR
		FRANKLIN (J & S) LTD	GB
		UNIQUE GROUP (UNIQUE TECH LTD)	GB
		FENOMEN MAKINA INSAAT	TR
		AVS SARACIYE TEKSTIL KONFEKSIYON SP	TR
		OUTDOOR RESEARCH	US
		LATINO CONFECOES LDA	PT
		GALEB DD	HR
STE16020A	01/12/2016	EXPAL SYSTEMS SA	ES
		NAMMO PALENCIA SL	ES
KTU160009	02/12/2016	CAE STS LIMITED	GB
		FLIGHTSAFETY INTERNATIONAL INC	US
TPA	02/12/2016	IMRES BV	NL







**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 14 NOV TO 20 NOVEMBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 14 NOV AU 20 NOVEMBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
<b>SHE16021</b>	<b>16/11/2016</b>	<b>ETRONICS</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>EUREP INDUSTRIES</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>S.E.F.INDUSTRIE SAS</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>SUYFA DEFENCE</b>	<b>ES</b>
		<b>ELVESIX BVBA</b>	<b>BE</b>
		<b>AART ELECTRONICS</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>MAINTLOG</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>GLÜCKAUF LOGISTIK GMBH</b>	<b>DE</b>
		<b>FPM</b>	<b>FR</b>
<b>TPA16023</b>	<b>18/11/2016</b>	<b>FLUART INNOVATIVE VACCINES</b>	<b>HU</b>
		<b>SANOFI PASTEUR</b>	<b>FR</b>





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS REVISED  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 7 NOV TO 13 NOVEMBER 2016 MODIFIÉ  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 07 NOV AU 13 NOVEMBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
FJA16025	09/11/2016	CHEMRING COUNTERMEASURES LTD	GB
STE16021	11/11/2016	RHEINMETALL WAFFE MUNITION GMBH	DE
FJA16022	11/11/2016	ESPLODENTI SABINO SRL SPREWERK LUEBBEN GMBH	IT DE
		EXPAL SYSTEMS SA	ES
DDZ16001	13/11/2016	ROHLIG LOGISTICS POL-MARE SP ZOO DSV AIR & SEA AS MATRIX RELOCATIONS EOOD	GB PL DK BG
CHR16040	09/11/2016	LEONARDO SPA INTERSOFT ELECTRONICS ROHDE & SCHWARZ BENELUX BV INDRA CARRETERA	IT BE NL ES
PRE16037	04/11/2016	JANSON BRIDGING BV	NL









**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY**  
**AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS**  
**SOUSSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS**  
**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 24 TO 30 OCTOBER 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES SOUMMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 24 AU 30 OCTOBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
HGR160085	26/10/2016	INTEGRATED PROCUREMENT TECHNOLOGIES	US
ABO16013	28/10/2016	COMERCIAL HERNANDO MORENO COHEMO SL	ES
		GRUPO JPG SA	ES
		REPUESTOS MENENDEZ SL	ES
		STAR DEFENCE LOGISTICS	ES
		SUYFA DEFENCE SL	ES
		MAINTLOG	FR
		SCADEFENSA SA	ES
ANH16023	28/10/2016	RHEINMETALL MAN MILITARY VEHICLES	DE
		KRAUSS-MAFFEI WEGMANN GMBH & CO KG	DE
		FFG FLENSBURGER FAHRZEUGBAU GMBH	DE
		GLOBAL LOGISTICS SUPPORT GMBH	DE
		KIDDE-DEUGRA	DE
FJA16026A	27/10/2016	MES SPA	IT
		EXPAL SYSTEMS, SA	ES



		<b>SIMMEL DIFESA SPA</b>	<b>IT</b>
		<b>RHEINMETALL WAFFE MUNITION GMBH</b>	<b>DE</b>





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY**  
**AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS**  
**SOUSSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS**  
**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 17 TO 23 OCTOBER 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES SOUMMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 17 AU 23 OCTOBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
MOK160013	18/10/2016	FEKA INSAAT SANAYI VE TICARET A.S.	TR
STE16022	18/10/2016	ESPLODENTI SABINO S.R.L. EXPAL SYSTEMS, S.A. MUNI BERKA GMBH NAMMO BUCK GMBH SPREWERK LUBBEN GMBH	IT ES DE DE DE
TPA16020	20/10/2016	AIMPOINT AB	SE





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 10 TO 16 OCTOBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 10 AU 16 OCTOBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
ABO16015	11/10/2015	HELIOS DR. BULLE GMBH	DE
		PEDERSEN OSKAR	NO
		FRANKLIN LTD	UK
		MECHANICAL SPARE PARTS FRANCE	FR
		DEW ENGINEERING ULC	CA
		UNIQUE GROUP	UK
		INTEGRACION TECNOLOGICA EMPRESARIAL	ES
		EUROSEC OU	EE
		AP SERVICES A/S	DK
		SUYFA DEFENCE	ES
KTU160007	14/10/2016	VEXCEL IMAGING GMBH	AT
TPA16015	16/10/2016	AAR MANUFACTURING INC.	US





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 03 TO 09 OCTOBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 03 AU 09 OCTOBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
LEF16011	05/10/2016	RIVOLIER SAS	FR
		HUMBERT CTTS	FR





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 26 SEPTEMBER TO 02 OCTOBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 26 SEPTEMBRE AU 02 OCTOBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
AAR16180	26/09/2016	SECURE COMPONENTS LLC	US
		AVIATRIX INC	US
		KELLSTROM DEFENSE AEROSPACE	US
		WESCO MANUFACTURING INC	US
		DEFENSE TRADING CORPORATION	US
		PARTYARD LDA	PT
STE16019	29/09/2016	ARMTEC COUNTERMEASURES CO.	US
STE16020	29/09/2016	NAMMO PALENCIA SL	ES
		EXPAL SYSTEMS SA	ES
JBR16A094	30/09/2016	NONE/AUCUNE	





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 19 TO 25 SEPTEMBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 19 AU 25 SEPTEMBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
ABO16010	21/092016	SUYFA DEFENCE	ES
		SNAP ON HOLDINGS GMBH	DE
		SCADEFENSA SL	ES
TPA16006	23/09/2016	EQUIMODAL SL	ES
		FHF FLURFOERDERGERAETE GMBH	DE
		IMUT SA	RO
		SEA BOX INC	US
		SICOM SPA	IT
		UNITEAM A/S	NO
		MERULAS	TR





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 12 TO 18 SEPTEMBER 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 12 AU 18 SEPTEMBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
MOK160012	12/09/2016	77 INSAAT VE TAAHHUT A.S.	TR
		ANT INSAAT MADEN SANAYI A.S.	TR
		FEKA INSAAT SANAYI VE TICARET A.S.	TR
		IDEAL SECIM INSAAT TAAHHUT VE DIS TICARET LIMITED SIRKETI	TR
		ACCESS POINT GROUP	AF
ABO16008	13/09/2016	HAYWARD & GREEN AVIATION LTD	GB
		SUYFA DEFENCE SL	ES
		HELPELEK SA	BE
		FPM	FR
		ELCOS BVBA	BE
		AART ELECTRONICS	FR
		ESDA GLOBAL LLC	US
HGR160057	15/09/2016	SAFRAN POWER UNITS	FR
		ESPA SARL	FR
		S3 INTERNATIONAL, LLC	US
		AART ELECTRONICS	FR
DCO16026	16/09/2016	REMOTE DIAGNOSTIC TECHNOLOGIES LTD	UK





<b>GSC16LS100/300</b>	<b>13/09/2016</b>	<b>RUSLAN SALIS GMBH</b>	<b>DE</b>
		<b>ANTONOV AIRLINES</b>	<b>UA</b>





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS (2<sup>nd</sup> REVISED)  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS (2<sup>nd</sup> CORRIGE)  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 05 TO 11 SEPTEMBER 2016 (2<sup>nd</sup> REVISED)  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 05 AU 11 SEPTEMBRE 2016 (2<sup>nd</sup> CORRIGE)**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
JBR16A001	09/09/2016	RENAULT TRUCK DEFENSE	FR
		GENERAL MECCANICA SRL	IT
		NEBIM BV	NL
GSC16LS001	09/09/2016	GRIMALDI AGENCIES UK LTD	GB
		SPLIETHOFF TRANSPORT B.V.	NL
		AUTOLINK LITHUANIA	LT
		DFDS A/S	DK
		GRIMALDI AGENCIES IT	IT
AHE16005	05/09/2016	MAXCOM PETROLI S.p.A	IT
		AEGFUELS	US
		UNIOIL SUPPLY	DK





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY**  
**AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS**  
**SOUSSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS**  
**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 29 AUGUST TO 04 SEPTEMBER 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES SOUMMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 29 AOUT AU 04 SEPTEMBRE 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
STE16018	31/08/2016	ZVI AS HOLECKOVA	CZ





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820.000,00 EUROS  
SOUMISSIONS AU DESSUS DE 820.000,00 EUROS  
BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 22 TO 28 AUGUST 2016  
OUVERTURE DES SOUMISSIONS SEMAINE DU 22 AU 28 AOUT 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
ELK16023	22/08/2016	GLUECKAUF-LOGISTIK GMBH	DE
		IVECO ESPANA SL	ES
		REPUESTOS MENENDEZ SL	ES
		SUYFA DEFENCE SL	ES
		GENOVESE UMBERTO SRL	IT
		COLEOPTER SL	ES
		GLOBAL LOGISTICS SUPPORT GMBH	DE
		FWW FAHRZEUGWERK GMBH	DE
		VDW ENGINEERING SA	BE
		TEHAGES BV	NL
		RHEINMETALL CHEMPRO	DE
		GENTAS GMBH	DE
TPA16014	26/08/2016	CATERPILLAR INC	US
		BERGERAT MONNOYEUR	FR
		PARTYARD LDA AV	PT





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820,000.00 EUR WEEK FROM 15 TO 21 AUGUST 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 15 AU 21 AOUT 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
TPA16009	19/08/2016	SUNROCK	FR
		COSTAS SIAMIDIS SA	GR
		POINT BLANK ENTERPRISES INC	US
		STIMPEX SA	RO
		LEVEL PEAKS ASSOCIATES	GB
		PAUL BOYE SA	FR
		MEHLER VARIO SYSTEM GMBH	DE
		PROTECOP SA	FR





NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D’ACQUISITION



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820,000.00 EUR WEEK FROM 01 TO 07 AUGUST 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 01 AU 07 AOUT 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS

**No bid openings  
Aucune ouverture des plis**





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS ABOVE 820,000.00 EUR WEEK FROM 25 TO 31 JULY 2016  
REVISED  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 25 AU 31 JUILLET 2016 CORRIGEE**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
JHA160004R	25/07/2016	READINESS MANAGEMENT SUPPORT	US
		MIDWEST ATC SERVICE INC	US
JDD160002	26/07/2016	ECOLOG INTERNATIONAL DEUTSCHLAND GMBH	DE
		OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LIMITED	GB
		ACCL HANDELSGESELLSCHAFT MBH	DE
MPI16125R1	26/07/2016	INTEGRATED PROCUREMENT TECHNOLOGIES	US
STE16014	26/07/2016	SPREWERK LUEBBEN GMBH	DE
		ENERGOTECH SA	RO
		NAMMO BUCK GMBH	DE
		ESPLODENTI SABINO SRL	IT
		MUNI BERKA GMBH	DE
		EXPAL SYSTEMS SA	ES
MJB16010	28/07/2016	UNIQUE GROUP	GB
CDL16001	29/07/2016	THE BOEING COMPANY	US
KME160120U	29/07/2016	WESCO MANUFACTURING INC	US
		AERO PRECISION	US
		BLUE AEROSPACE	US
		INTEGRATED PROCUREMENT TECHNOLOGIES	US



		<b>DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT INC</b>	<b>US</b>
<b>MPI16250</b>	<b>29/07/2016</b>	<b>WESCO MANUFACTURING INC</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT INC</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>SIMTECH INC</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>MECANEX USA INC</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>S3 INTERNATIONAL, LLC</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>BELL HELICOPTER</b>	<b>NL</b>
		<b>AW TRONICS HOLDING</b>	<b>BG</b>
		<b>NORTH SHORE COMPONENTS</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>DEFENSE TRADING CORPORATION</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>ALL-SYSTEM AEROSPACE</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>BLUE AEROSPACE</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>MILLS/STERLING AEROSPACE, INC</b>	<b>CA</b>
		<b>FEDERAL DEFENSE INDUSTRIES, INC</b>	<b>US</b>
<b>APL16007</b>	<b>29/07/2016</b>	<b>SALT SEPARATION SERVICES LTD</b>	<b>GB</b>
		<b>SIMAV SPA</b>	<b>IT</b>
		<b>PURE H2O A/S</b>	<b>DK</b>
		<b>ALBATROS SRL</b>	<b>IT</b>



[www.nspa.nato.int](http://www.nspa.nato.int) ■ 11 rue de la Gare, L-8325 Capellen ■ [pp@nspa.nato.int](mailto:pp@nspa.nato.int)









**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 04 TO 10 JULY 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 04 AU 10 JUILLET 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
ABO16006	04/07/2016	SUYFA DEFENCE	ES
		CRISTANINI	IT
SSA160063	05/07/2015	NEXTER SYSTEMS	FR
		DIGITEST & URUK ADI ORTAKLIGI	TR
MUO16021	06/07/2016	NOBEL SPORT S.A	FR
STE16013	07/07/2016	SELLIER & BELLOT JSC	CZ
STE16015	07/07/2016	SELLIER & BELLOT JSC	CZ
HGR160053R	08/07/2016	ULTRA ELECTRONICS SONAR SYSTEMS	GB





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 27 JUNE TO 03 JULY 2016 Revised  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 27 JUIN AU 03 JUILLET 2016 Corrige**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
PIO16010	27/06/2016	TVK-EUROPE E.K.	DE
		MAINTLOG	FR
		GENTAS	DE
		GLOBAL LOGISTICS SUPPORT GMBH	DE
		HERKULES FAHRZEUGLOGISTIK GMBH	DE
		STAR DEFENCE LOGISTICS	ES
		SUYFA DEFENCE	ES
		ELVESIX BVBA	BE
		PART YARD LDA	PT
		FPM	FR
		IVECO ESPANA SL	ES
HGR160053		NONE/AUCUNE	
STE16010	30/06/2016	SAE ALSETEX	FR



[www.nspa.nato.int](http://www.nspa.nato.int) ■ 11 rue de la Gare, L-8325 Capellen ■ [pp@nspa.nato.int](mailto:pp@nspa.nato.int)







**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 13 JUNE TO 19 JUNE 2016 Revised  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 13 JUNE AU 19 JUIN 2016 Corrige**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
KTU160003	13/06/2016	BLUE AEROSPACE LLC	US
		AERO INTERNATIONAL INC	US
		AUTOFLUG GMBH	DE
		TGH AVIATION	US
		WESCO MANUFACTURING INC	US
		MHD-ROCKLAND	CA
		ETS GMBH	DE
MJB16004	16/06/2016	YUMA SA	ES
ECA16002	16/06/2016	HHI CORPORATION	US
		CV INTERNATIONAL INC	US
		RIVERS METAL PRODUCTS INC	US
		FLEXIBLE LIFELINE SYSTEMS	US





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 06 JUNE TO 12 JUNE 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 06 JUNE AU 12 JUIN 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
ABO16004	07/06/2016	SUYFA DEFENCE	ES
		DEFENSE TRADING CORPORATION	US
		SURVITEC GROUP	DE
SLI16082	10/06/2016	DEFENSE TRADING CORPORATION	US
		TRANSUPPORT, INC	US
		S3 INTERNATIONAL, LLC	US
		M INTERNATIONAL, INC	US
		HAYWARD AND GREEN DEFENCE LIMITED	GB
		DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT, INC.	US
		ALL-SYSTEM AEROSPACE, INC.	US
		SIMTECH	US
		AEROSPACE LOGISTICS LTD	GB







**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 30 MAY TO 05 JUNE 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 30 MAI AU 05 JUIN 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
CLE160016	31/05/2016	COLUMBIA HELICOPTERS, INC.	US
		AT ENGINE CONTROLS LTD	GB
		ROLLS-ROYCE PLC	GB
CLE160017	31/05/2016	COLUMBIA HELICOPTERS, INC.	US
		AT ENGINE CONTROLS LTD	GB
		ROLLS-ROYCE PLC	GB
CLE160015	31/05/2016	COLUMBIA HELICOPTERS, INC.	US
		HAYWARD AND GREEN DEFENCE LTD	GB
		AT ENGINE CONTROLS LTD	GB
		AEROSPACE LOGISTICS LTD	GB
		AVIATION SPARES INTERNATIONAL	GB
		ISS GMBH	DE
CLE160013	31/05/2016	COLUMBIA HELICOPTERS, INC.	US
		HAYWARD AND GREEN DEFENCE LTD	GB
		BRITISH FILTERS LIMITED	GB
		AT ENGINE CONTROLS LTD	GB
		AEROSPACE LOGISTICS LTD	GB
		AVIATION SPARES INTERNATIONAL	GB
		ROLLS-ROYCE PLC	GB
		MILLS/STERLING AEROSPACE, INC	CA
		INEO GLOBAL SUPPORT, INC	US
MNE160009	03/06/2016	IBATECH TECNOLOGIA SLU	ES
		IMEBIO	FR



NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
 AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 23 TO 29 MAY 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 23 AU 29 MAI 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS

**No bid openings**  
**Aucune ouverture des plis**





NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
 AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 16 TO 22 MAY 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 16 AU 22 MAI 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS

**No bid openings**  
**Aucune ouverture des plis**





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 09 TO 15 MAY 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 09 AU 15 MAI 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
HLO160035R	10/05/2016	ISS GMBH	DE
		AVIATION SPARES INTERNATIONAL	GB
		AR-TECH INTERNATIONAL, INC.	US
		HAYWARD & GREEN DEFENCE LTD.	GB
		SOI AVIATION	US
JHA160001	09/05/2016	ATCO FRONTEC EUROPE LTD.	HU
		G3 SYSTEMS LTD.	GB
PDU160002	10/05/2016	G3 SYSTEMS LTD.	GB
		FEKA INSAAT SANAYI VE TICARET A.S.	TR
		OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD	GB
PDU160003	10/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD	GB
		ECOLOG INTERNATIONAL DEUTSCHLAND GMBH	DE
PDU160004	10/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD	GB
		G3 SYSTEMS LTD.	GB
		COPENHAGEN CONTRACTORS A/S	DK
FJA16017	11/05/2016	SIMMEL DIFESA S.P.A	IT
		MECAR S.A.	BE
		MES S.P.A.	IT
KTU160001	13/05/2016	WESCO MANUFACTURING, INC.	US

		<b>AERO INTERNATIONAL, INC.</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>AEROKOOL AVIATION</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>BLUE AEROSPACE</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>VHL AIRCRAFT INC.</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>EUROFLY SERVICE SRL</b>	<b>IT</b>
		<b>MHD-ROCKLAND</b>	<b>CA</b>
		<b>AIRBUS DEFENCE AND SPACE</b>	<b>ES</b>
		<b>AEM LIMITED</b>	<b>GB</b>



www.nspa.nato.int ■ 11 rue de la Gare, L-8325 Capellen ■ pp@nspa.nato.int





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 02 TO 08 MAY 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 02 AU 08 MAI 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
JHA160002	02/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD	GB
JHA160003	02/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD	GB
JHA160004	02/05/2016	READINESS MANAGEMENT SUPPORT, L.C. MIDWEST AIR TRAFFIC CONTROL SERVICE, INC	US US
JHA160005	02/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD	GB
JVE160002	02/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD ECOLOG INTERNATIONAL DEUTSCHLAND GMBH JIMCO INTERNATIONAL, LLC	GB DE US
JVE160003	02/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD ECOLOG INTERNATIONAL DEUTSCHLAND GMBH	GB DE
JVE160004	02/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD ECOLOG INTERNATIONAL DEUTSCHLAND GMBH READINESS MANAGEMENT SUPPORT, L.C.	GB DE US
JVE160005	02/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD	GB
JVE160006	02/05/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD	GB

<b>FGI160001</b>	<b>02/05/2016</b>	<b>JIMCO INTERNATIONAL, LLC</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>CENTERRA SERVICES INTERNATIONAL, INC.</b>	<b>US</b>
<b>FGI160002</b>	<b>02/05/2016</b>	<b>OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD</b>	<b>GB</b>
		<b>G3 SYSTEMS LTD</b>	<b>GB</b>
<b>FGI160003</b>	<b>02/05/2016</b>	<b>HSS ENGINEERING APS</b>	<b>DK</b>
<b>FGI160004</b>	<b>02/05/2016</b>	<b>EMW, INC.</b>	<b>US</b>
<b>FGI160006</b>	<b>02/05/2016</b>	<b>EMW, INC.</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>OVERSEAS SUPPLY SERVICES LTD</b>	<b>GB</b>
		<b>AMERICAN SCIENCE &amp; ENGINEERING, INC.</b>	<b>US</b>
<b>DCO16009</b>	<b>05/05/2016</b>	<b>CP CASES LTD</b>	<b>GB</b>
		<b>CP FRANCE</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>FAES GROUP BV</b>	<b>NL</b>
		<b>MV PARTS</b>	<b>BE</b>
		<b>SCANTEC INDUSTRIES NV</b>	<b>BE</b>
		<b>BLAUWSTOF</b>	<b>NL</b>
		<b>SUYFA DEFENCE</b>	<b>ES</b>
		<b>GT-LINE SRL</b>	<b>IT</b>



www.nspa.nato.int ■ 11 rue de la Gare, L-8325 Capellen ■ pp@nspa.nato.int





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 25 APRIL TO 01 MAY 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 25 AVRIL AU 01 MAI 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
FJA16014	28/04/2016	SIMMEL DIFESA S.P.A.	IT
		MES S.P.A.	IT
FJA16002R1	28/04/2016	UTC AEROSPACE SYSTEMS	US
		INTEGRATED PROCUREMENT TECHNOLOGIES	US
FJA16003R1	28/04/2016	UTC AEROSPACE SYSTEMS	US
		INTEGRATED PROCUREMENT TECHNOLOGIES	US
JDV16018R1	29/04/2016	COVER TECHNOLOGY	IT
		BRESCIANI	IT
		COPENHAGEN	DK
		G&G PARTNERS	IT
FGI160005	25/04/2016	NONE/AUCUNE	
PIO16007	27/04/2016	WINGSTORE	PL
		BRUGGEMANN GMBH & CO KG	DE
		DOKASCH GMBH	DE
		GPI FORANKRA	FR







**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 18 APRIL TO 24 APRIL 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 18 AVRIL AU 24 AVRIL 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
PRE16010	21/04/2016	ALFA IMPIANTI S.R.L.	IT
		ASTI ENGINEERING S.R.L.	IT
		COSAP	IT
		VITROCISSET SPA	IT
		WEST SYSTEMS S.R.L.	IT
		GSM IMPIANTI S.R.L.	IT
		ALFREDO CECCHINI S.R.L.	IT
		MEDINOK SPA	IT
		SIMAV SPA	IT
		IG OPERATION AND MAINTENANCE SPA	IT
MUO16012	19/04/2016	SIMMEL DIFESA S.P.A.	IT
FJA16006	21/04/2016	MES S.P.A. MECCANICA PER L'ELETTRONICA E SERVOMECCANISMI	IT
FJA16011	21/04/2016	VAZOVSKI MASHINOSTROITELNI ZAVODI EAD	BG
FSC160001	18/04/2016	KEPI INTERNATIONAL SOLUTIONS LTD	GB
		OCT INSAAT TAAH TIC VE SAN LTD STI	TR
		FEKA INSAAT SAN VE TIC AS	TR
		BILTEK ORGANIZASYON MUHENDISLIK	TR
		CONTECH INSAAT TAAHHUT ITHALAT	TR

		<b>PROJE A INSAAT MUHENDISLIK</b>	<b>TR</b>
		<b>EMTA INSAAT AS</b>	<b>TR</b>
<b>STO160002</b>	<b>18/04/2016</b>	<b>ECOLOG INTERNATIONAL DEUTSCHLAND GMBH</b>	<b>DE</b>
<b>BBE15900</b>	<b>22/04/2016</b>	<b>CENTRO SERVIZI DERNA SRL</b>	<b>IT</b>
		<b>CONTEMAR LDA</b>	<b>PT</b>
		<b>DINAMO PROJE LTD</b>	<b>TR</b>
		<b>EXPORT CREATING BUSINESS SL</b>	<b>ES</b>
		<b>GREEK PORT SERVICES LTD</b>	<b>GR</b>
		<b>LA MERCANTILE SRL</b>	<b>IT</b>
		<b>LOGISTIC SOLUTIONS EUROPE LTD</b>	<b>BG</b>
		<b>SCA - SHIPPING CONSULTANTS</b>	<b>IT</b>
		<b>WILHELMSSEN SHIPS SERVICE AS</b>	<b>NO</b>
		<b>PERGE DENIZCILIK VE GEMI ACENTELIGI</b>	<b>TR</b>
		<b>MLS OVERSEAS LTD</b>	<b>GB</b>
		<b>SISAM AGENTI SRL</b>	<b>IT</b>
		<b>GEDVEC DEFENSE LOGISTICS SRL</b>	<b>RO</b>
		<b>INCHCAPE SHIPPING SERVICES</b>	<b>GB</b>



www.nspa.nato.int ■ 11 rue de la Gare, L-8325 Capellen ■ pp@nspa.nato.int



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 11 APRIL TO 17 APRIL 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 11 AVRIL AU 17 AVRIL 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
JDD160001	11/04/2016	COPENHAGEN CONTRACTORS A/S	DK
		READINESS MANAGEMENT SUPPORT L.C.	US
		JIMCO INTERNATIONAL, LLC	US
JKO16001	12/04/2016	PROXIFUEL NV	BE
		PETROLIHM NV	BE
		CALPAM BELGIUM NV	BE
		OCTA+ ENERGIE	BE
		CALPAM LUXEMBOURG SARL	LU
		TOTAL LUXEMBOURG S.A	LU



NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 4 APRIL TO 10 APRIL 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 4 AVRIL AU 10 AVRIL 2016**

<b>COLLECTIVE #</b>	<b>CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE</b>	<b>COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE</b>	<b>COUNTRY / PAYS</b>
<b>DCO16007</b>	<b>04 APR 2016</b>	<b>AB PRECISION (POOLE) LTD</b>	<b>GB</b>
		<b>EMD EQUIPEMENT METIERS DEFENSE</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>MED-ENG LLC</b>	<b>US</b>
		<b>NIC INSTRUMENTS LTD</b>	<b>GB</b>
		<b>SUYFA DEFENCE</b>	<b>ES</b>





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 28 MARCH TO 3 APRIL 2016 (2<sup>nd</sup> Revised)  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 28 MARS AU 3 AVRIL 2016 (2<sup>nd</sup> Corrige)**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
JLA16A003	28/03/2016	L-3 COMMUNICATIONS ELECTRONIC SYSTEMS	CA
		TECNOBIT SLU	ES
		FERRANTI TECHNOLOGIES LTD	UK
		THALES PROGRAMAS DE ELECTRONICA	ES
PIO16001	31/03/2016	BOSCHUNG ENVIRONNEMENT SARL	FR
		EUROPE SERVICE	FR
		FRESIA S.p.A.	IT
		SAS Val'Air	FR
APL16044	30/03/2016	RHEINMETALL MAN MILITARY VEHICLES GMBH	DE
GPO16021	31/03/2016	NEXTER SYSTEMS	FR
		DIGITEST&URUK ADI ORTAKLIGI	TR





NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
 AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 21 MARCH TO 27 MARCH 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 21 MARS AU 27 MARS 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
STE15032A	21/03/2016	ARMTEC COUNTERMEASURES Co.	US





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY**  
**AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 14 MARCH TO 20 MARCH 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 14 MARS AU 20 MARS 2016**

<b>COLLECTIVE #</b>	<b>CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE</b>	<b>COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE</b>	<b>COUNTRY / PAYS</b>
<b>MJB16002</b>	<b>14/03/2016</b>	<b>TATRA TEXTIL s.r.o.</b>	<b>SK</b>
		<b>TYPHOON INTERNATIONAL Ltd.</b>	<b>UK</b>
		<b>COSTAS SIAMIDIS S.A.</b>	<b>GR</b>



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 07 MARCH TO 13 MARCH 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 07 MARS AU 13 MARS 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
MUO16008	09/03/2016	EXPAL SYSTEMS S.A.	ES
		SIMMEL DIFESA S. p. A.	IT





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 29 FEBRUARY TO 06 MARCH 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 29 FEBRUARY AU 06 MARS 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
HGR160009	01/03/2016	BLUE AEROSPACE	US
		SIMTECH, INC.	US
		DEFENSE TECHNOLOGY EQUIPMENT, INC.	US





BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 22 TO 28 FEBRUARY 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 22 AU 28 FEVRIER 2016

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS

No bid openings  
Aucune ouverture des plis





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 15 TO 21 FEBRUARY 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 15 AU 21 FEVRIER 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
JDV15024	15/02/2016	EQUIPOS MOVILES DE CAMPANA ARPA S.A.U	ES
		O.M.A.R. TECHNOLOGY S.r.L.	IT
		GAROFOLI S.p.A.	IT
		KARBOX s.r.o	CZ
FSC150018	18/02/2016	BAUSCHMIDT UAB	LT
		FEKA INSAAT SANAYI VE TICARET A.S.	TR
		HATCON INSAAT TAAHHUT ITHALAT IHRACAT LTD STI	TR
		HESA LTD.	TR
		UAB "INTI"	LT
		KONSOLE, UAB	LT
		KUANTA INSAAT TAAHHUT ELEKTRONIK TUR. SAN VE TIC. A.S.	TR
		UAB, MITNIJA	LT
SHE16001	18/02/2016	OCT INSAAT TAAHHUT TICARET VE SANAYI LTD. STI.	TR
		AP SERVICES GLOBAL FIRST AID	DK
		COMBAT MEDICAL SYSTEMS	US
		FARETEC INC.	US
		PERSYS MEDICAL	US
		REMOTE MEDICAL INTERNATIONAL	US
		SILVERT MEDICAL S.A.R.L.	FR
		TACTICAL MEDICAL SOLUTIONS	US
	OSKAR PEDERSEN AS	NO	

		<b>SUYFA DEFENCE, S.L.</b>	<b>ES</b>
		<b>SHARKMED OY</b>	<b>FI</b>
		<b>PC EQUIPMENT</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>EQUIPEMENTS DES METIERS DE LA DEFENSE</b>	<b>FR</b>
		<b>CORBEN</b>	<b>FR</b>



[www.nspa.nato.int](http://www.nspa.nato.int) ■ 11 rue de la Gare, L-8325 Capellen ■ [pp@nspa.nato.int](mailto:pp@nspa.nato.int)





NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 08 TO 14 FEBRUARY 2015**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 08 AU 14 FEVRIER 2015**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
CDL15001	11/02/2016	STAPLES EUROPE B.V.	NL
		OFFICE DEPOT EUROPE B.V.	NL
ANH15030	11/02/2016	AVIABALTIKA AVIATION, Ltd	LT
		AVIONAMS JSC	BG
		LOMP PRAHA s.p.	CZ
		LETECKE OPRAVOVNE TRENCIN, AS	SK
		HELISOTA UAB	LT
		AAL-USA	US





NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
 AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 01 TO 07 FEBRUARY 2015**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 01 AU 07 FEVRIER 2015**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS

**No bid openings**  
**Aucune ouverture des plis**





**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 25 TO 31 JANUARY 2016 (Revised)**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 25 AU 31 JANVIER 2016 (Corrige)**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
STO150006	25/01/2016	OVERSEAS SUPPLIES SERVICES LIMITED	GB
		ECOLOG INTERNATIONAL DEUTSCHLAND GMBH	DE
STE16004	29/01/2016	AREX D.O.O SENTJERNEJ	SI
		SIA "D DUPLEKS"	LV
		NAMMO BAKELITTFABRIKKEN AS	NO





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 18 TO 24 JANUARY 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 18 AU 24 JANVIER 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS

**No bid openings  
Aucune ouverture des plis**





**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 11 TO 17 JANUARY 2016**  
**OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 11 AU 17 JANVIER 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
FJA15052R1	14/01/2016	EXPAL SYSTEMS, S.A.	ES
		RHEINMETALL WAFFE MUNITION GMBH	DE





**NATO SUPPORT AND PROCUREMENT AGENCY  
AGENCE OTAN DE SOUTIEN ET D'ACQUISITION**



**BID OPENINGS WEEK FROM 4 TO 10 JANUARY 2016  
OUVERTURE DES PLIS SEMAINE 4 AU 10 JANVIER 2016**

COLLECTIVE #	CLOSING DATE / DATE DE CLOTURE	COMPANIES WHO PROVIDED AN OFFER / FIRMES AYANT SOUMIS UNE OFFRE	COUNTRY / PAYS
FSC150017	04/01/2016	HATCON INSAAT LTD STI	TR
		FEKA INSAAAT SANAYI VE TICARET A.S.	TR
		AMHOLD LTD.	EE
		KUANTA INSAAT TAAHHUT ELEKTRONIK TUR. SAN. VE TIC. A.S.	TR
		OCT INSAAT TAAHHUT TICARET VE SANAYI LTD. STI.	TR
		SMK ULUSAL INSAAT VE TICARET A.S.	TR
		UAB "MITNIJA"	LT
		HESA LTD.	TR

